

Preliminary Bid Tabulation

		Description & Senior Center	Description & Senior Center	Description & Senior Center	
		12.5 ton RTU Robert Bowen Center	15 ton RTU Ruth Peterson Center	7.5 ton RTU Ruth Peterson Center	TOTAL COST
Bidders Name/Company					
1	No Bid Bond Systemp Corporation Rochester Hills	\$ 16,713.00	\$ 18,713.00	\$ 11,713.00	\$ 47,139.00
2	No Bid Bond Lizut Mechanical Inc Pontiac	\$ 10,995.00	\$ 13,595.00	\$ 10,595.00	\$ 35,185.00
3	No Bid Bond Nichols Htg & Clg Waterford	\$ 10,220.00	\$ 13,900.00	\$ 9,190.00	\$ 33,310.00
4	No Bid Bond Walker's Htg & Clg Detroit	\$ 11,657.61	\$ 16,825.14	\$ 9,703.41	\$ 38,186.16
5	MJ Mechanical Srvcs St. Charles	\$ 23,000.00	\$ 19,800.00	\$ 16,500.00	\$ 59,300.00
6	Miller-Boldt Inc Sterling Heights	\$ 40,000.00	\$ 26,000.00	\$ 31,000.00	\$ 97,000.00
7	Discovery Mechanical Clarkston	\$ 13,590.00	\$ 15,452.00	\$ 11,840.00	\$ 40,882.00
8		\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -
9		\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -
10		\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -
11		\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -
12		\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -

Name/Work Activity : HVAC Rplcmnt for Senior Centers _____

City of Pontiac
47450 Woodward Ave.
Pontiac, MI 48342

Date/Time: 3/30/17 @ 2:00 PM _____

Witness: Michelle McKenzie, Purchasing Agent _____

Witness: _____

Opened by: Sherikia Hawkins, City Clerk _____