

City of Pontiac
2017 Mowing Services Bid Tab Form
Mini Parks and Vacant City Lots

Description	Elam Service Group			Xpert Lawn and Snow			Ozell Brownlee		
	2017	2018	2019	2017	2018	2019	2017	2018	2019
A Mini Parks	\$5,590.00	\$5,590.00	\$5,590.00	\$5,040.00	\$5,040.00	\$5,040.00	\$6,276.00	\$6,589.44	\$6,918.60
Correction in the addition ADJ	\$5,160.00	\$5,160.00	\$5,160.00						
B Vacant City Lots	\$3,000.00	\$3,000.00	\$3,000.00	\$3,600.00	\$3,600.00	\$3,600.00	\$918.66	\$964.56	\$1,012.74
C Vacant City Lots	\$3,018.00	\$3,018.00	\$3,018.00	\$3,510.00	\$3,510.00	\$3,510.00	\$822.90	\$864.06	\$907.32
D Vacant City Lots	\$2,970.00	\$2,970.00	\$2,970.00	\$3,510.00	\$3,510.00	\$3,510.00	\$773.88	\$812.64	\$852.90
E Vacant City Lots	\$2,940.00	\$2,940.00	\$2,940.00	\$3,540.00	\$3,540.00	\$3,540.00	\$745.92	\$783.24	\$822.24
F Vacant City Lots	\$2,940.00	\$2,940.00	\$2,940.00	\$3,390.00	\$3,390.00	\$3,390.00	\$649.56	\$682.08	\$716.22
G Vacant City Lots	\$2,940.00	\$2,940.00	\$2,940.00	\$3,510.00	\$3,510.00	\$3,510.00	\$663.78	\$697.08	\$731.94
H Vacant City Lots	\$3,000.00	\$3,000.00	\$3,000.00	\$3,570.00	\$3,570.00	\$3,570.00	\$903.12	\$951.24	\$998.82
I Vacant City Lots	\$3,000.00	\$3,000.00	\$3,000.00	\$3,570.00	\$3,570.00	\$3,570.00	\$921.18	\$967.14	\$1,015.56
J Vacant City Lots	\$1,050.00	\$1,050.00	\$1,050.00	\$1,290.00	\$1,290.00	\$1,290.00	\$276.54	\$290.40	\$304.98

Total All Categories	\$30,538.00	\$30,538.00	\$30,538.00	\$34,530.00	\$34,530.00	\$34,530.00	\$12,951.54	\$13,601.88	\$14,281.32
ADJ	\$30,018.00	\$30,018.00	\$30,018.00						

Total price for all three years for all categories included in bid	\$91,344.00			\$103,590.00			\$40,834.74		
ADJ	\$90,054.00								

Additional Mowing Services		2017	2018	2019	2017	2018	2019	2017	2018	2019
Mowing Services	Sq Ft	\$0.20	\$0.20	\$0.20	\$0.01	\$0.01	\$0.01	no bid	no bid	no bid
Edging Services	Lin Ft	\$1.25	\$1.25	\$1.25	\$0.10	\$0.10	\$0.10	no bid	no bid	no bid

Witness: Michelle L. McKenzie, Purchasing Agent

Opened by City Clerk: Sherikia Hawkins

Date: 5/8/2017

City of Pontiac
47450 Woodward Ave.
Pontiac, MI 48342