

City of Pontiac
2017 Mowing Services Bid Tab Form
City Bldgs/MDOT ROW/Parks/Misc.

Description	Xpert Lawn and Snow			TDE Group			Elam Service Group			United Lawnscape, Inc.		
	2017	2018	2019	2017	2018	2019	2017	2018	2019	2017	2018	2019
A City Owned Facilities	\$7,820.00	\$7,820.00	\$7,820.00	\$11,500.00	\$11,500.00	\$11,500.00	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$7,510.00	\$7,760.00	\$7,760.00
B I-75 Business Loop	\$3,632.00	\$3,632.00	\$3,632.00	\$13,120.00	\$13,120.00	\$13,120.00	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$8,928.00	\$9,120.00	\$9,120.00
C M-59 Business Loop	\$6,816.00	\$6,816.00	\$6,816.00	\$12,960.00	\$12,960.00	\$12,960.00	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$4,480.00	\$4,560.00	\$4,560.00
D Parks Larger than 5 Acres	\$180,416.00	\$180,416.00	\$180,416.00	\$208,000.00	\$208,000.00	\$208,000.00	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$52,512.00	\$54,336.00	\$54,336.00
E Parks Under 5 Acres	\$8,080.00	\$8,080.00	\$8,080.00	\$18,720.00	\$18,720.00	\$18,720.00	\$6,880.00	\$6,880.00	\$6,880.00	\$13,504.00	\$14,432.00	\$14,432.00
F Major Streets	\$35,504.00	\$35,504.00	\$35,504.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$21,296.00	\$22,208.00	\$22,208.00
G Local Streets	\$5,525.00	\$5,525.00	\$5,525.00	\$12,000.00	\$12,000.00	\$12,000.00	\$6,000.00	\$6,000.00	\$6,000.00	\$6,000.00	\$6,240.00	\$6,240.00
H Miscellaneous	\$8,412.00	\$8,412.00	\$8,412.00	\$13,160.00	\$13,160.00	\$13,160.00	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$7,800.00	\$8,040.00	\$8,040.00
Total All Categories	\$256,205.00	\$256,205.00	\$256,205.00	\$289,460.00	\$289,460.00	\$289,460.00	\$12,880.00	\$12,880.00	\$12,880.00	\$122,030.00	\$126,696.00	\$126,696.00
Total price for all three years for all categories included in bid	\$768,615.00			\$868,380.00			\$38,640.00			\$375,422.00		

Additional Mowing Services		2017	2018	2019	2017	2018	2019	2017	2018	2019	2017	2018	2019
Mowing Services	1/2 Acre	\$35.00	\$35.00	\$35.00	\$20.00	\$20.00	\$20.00	\$28.00	\$28.00	\$28.00	\$0.01	\$0.01	\$0.01
Edging Services	Lin Ft	\$0.15	\$0.15	\$0.15	\$1.00	\$1.00	\$1.00	\$1.25	\$1.25	\$1.25	\$0.10	\$0.10	\$0.10

Witness: Michelle L. McKenzie, Purchasing Agent

Opened by City Clerk: Sherikia Hawkins

Date: 5/8/2017

City of Pontiac
47450 Woodward Ave.
Pontiac, MI 48342