

# CLARK HILL

P.L.C.

ATTORNEYS AT LAW

500 Woodward Avenue  
Suite 3500, Detroit, Michigan 48226-3435  
Telephone (313) 965-8300  
Fed.ID # 38-0425840

## INVOICE

Invoice # 802354

City of Pontiac, MI  
Attn: John Clark, Esq.  
c/o Giarmarco, Mullins & Horton P.C.  
Tenth Floor Columbia Center  
101 West Big Beaver Road  
Troy, MI 48084-5280

August 27, 2018  
Client: 18836  
Matter: 328362

=====

RE: City council advice and legal counsel

FOR SERVICES RENDERED through July 31, 2018

Total Services: \$9,390.00

FOR EXPENSES INCURRED OR ADVANCED:

Court Reporting/Transcript Fee \$11.60

Total Expenses: \$11.60

STATEMENT TOTAL \$9,401.60

04/06/18	771208	\$4140.00
05/17/18	781268	\$8851.50
06/12/18	785121	\$4525.50
07/13/18	792583	\$6235.75

Outstanding Balance: \$23,752.75

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE \$33,154.35

=====

PAYABLE UPON RECEIPT IN U.S. DOLLARS

CONFIDENTIAL

MEMORANDUM FOR THE DIRECTOR  
SUBJECT: [Illegible]

[Illegible text block]

[Illegible text block]

# CLARK HILL P.L.C.

City of Pontiac, MI  
August 27, 2018  
INVOICE # 802354  
Page 2

## DETAILED DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES

07/02/18 RMT	.50	Review and respond to memos regarding litigation status and strategy.
07/02/18 CMT	.30	Finalize brief for filing; communications with M. McInerney regarding same.
07/02/18 MWM	.50	Complete identification and assembly of exhibits for filing.
07/08/18 RMT	.40	Review and respond to memos regarding litigation status and strategy.
07/09/18 CMT	1.00	Telephone call with M. Sharpe regarding salary increases; review and revise resolution regarding same.
07/10/18 RMT	.60	Review file; confer with C. Trebilcock regarding litigation status and strategy.
07/11/18 MWM	.20	Initial review of Defendant's reply brief.
07/12/18 RMT	.30	Review and respond to memos regarding litigation status and strategy.
07/12/18 MWM	.70	Study Defendant's reply brief, discuss with C. Trebilcock; email to M. Sharpe.
07/13/18 RMT	.60	Review and respond to memos regarding litigation status and strategy.
07/16/18 RMT	.60	Review and respond to memos regarding litigation status and strategy.
07/19/18 RMT	.50	Review and respond to memos regarding litigation status and strategy.
07/19/18 CMT	.20	Review and respond to communications regarding oral argument.
07/23/18 CMT	.80	Communications with M. Sharpe, M. McInerney and R. Turner regarding hearing; review and analyze pleadings in preparation of hearing.

## CLARK HILL P.L.C.

City of Pontiac, MI  
August 27, 2018  
INVOICE # 802354  
Page 3

07/24/18 CMT	3.70	Prepare for oral argument regarding Motion to Dismiss; communications with M. Sharpe and M. McInerney regarding same.
07/24/18 MWM	.50	Review appearance from new counsel for Mayor and City Charter; preparation for hearing.
07/25/18 RMT	.70	Review and respond to memos regarding litigation status and strategy.
07/25/18 RMT	1.60	Confer with litigation team and appellate counsel regarding hearing on Motions and next steps regarding emergency appeal; review and revise proposed order.
07/25/18 CMF	.50	Conference call and appellate advice regarding papers to be filed in the court of appeals to challenge the trial court's ruling, including an emergency application for leave to appeal, motion for immediate consideration, and motion for peremptory reversal; provide requirements of the same to legal team.
07/25/18 CMT	3.60	Appear for and argue at hearing on Motion for Summary Disposition; follow-up communications regarding same with M. McInerney, M. Sharpe and R. Turner.
07/25/18 MWM	1.00	Discuss results of motion hearing and strategy with R. Turner and C. Trebilcock; review proposed order.
07/26/18 CMT	.50	Review and revise proposed order; communications with Defendants' counsel regarding same.
07/30/18 CMT	3.80	Begin drafting application for leave to appeal and peremptory reversal; research to confirm standard of review on declaratory judgment and review of city ordinances.
07/31/18 CMT	7.70	Continue to draft and revise application for appeal; review and analyze comments from R. Turner regarding same; draft and revise motion for peremptory reversal.
07/31/18 MWM	.50	Analysis and consultation regarding application for leave to appeal.

**CLARK HILL P.L.C.**

City of Pontiac, MI  
August 27, 2018  
INVOICE # 802354  
Page 4

\$9,390.00

TIMEKEEPER SUMMARY

RMT	Reginald M. Turner, Jr	5.80 hours at	\$300.00 =	\$1,740.00
CMF	Cynthia M. Filipovich	0.50 hours at	\$300.00 =	\$150.00
CMT	Christopher M. Trebilc	21.60 hours at	\$300.00 =	\$6,480.00
MWM	Mark W. McInerney	3.40 hours at	\$300.00 =	\$1,020.00