

# CLARK HILL

P.L.C.

ATTORNEYS AT LAW

500 Woodward Avenue  
Suite 3500, Detroit, Michigan 48226-3435  
Telephone (313) 965-8300  
Fed.ID # 38-0425840

## INVOICE

City of Pontiac, MI  
Attn: Law Department  
47450 Woodward Avenue  
Pontiac, MI 48342-5009

Invoice # 781268  
May 17, 2018  
Client: 18836  
Matter: 328362

=====

RE: City council advice and legal counsel

FOR SERVICES RENDERED through April 30, 2018

Total Services: \$8,851.50

INVOICE TOTAL \$8,851.50

2018 MAY 21 P 1:12  
RECEIVED  
ACCOUNTS PAYABLE

PAYABLE UPON RECEIPT IN U.S. DOLLARS

# CLARK HILL P.L.C.

City of Pontiac, MI  
City council advice and legal counsel  
May 17, 2018  
INVOICE # 781268  
Page 2

## DETAILED DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES

04/02/18 RMT	1.10	Review and respond to memos regarding opinions from counsel regarding matters pending before council; review and respond to memos regarding requests from City Council members.
04/02/18 CMT	1.20	Review, analyze and respond to question from R. Turner regarding duration of EM orders and authority of local governing body to modify.
04/03/18 RMT	.80	Review documents regarding termination of receivership; review documents regarding contracts; review and respond to memos regarding same.
04/03/18 CMT	.30	Review, analyze and respond to questions raised by R. Turner regarding EM Orders.
04/04/18 RMT	1.30	Review and respond to memos regarding matters pending before City Council; research regarding same.
04/04/18 CMT	.70	Review and respond to communications regarding EM Orders; review and analyze memorandum regarding legal contract and council resolutions; meet and confer with M. McInerney regarding same.
04/05/18 RMT	.70	Review and respond to memos regarding opinion from Giamarco firm; research regarding same.
04/05/18 CMT	1.40	Review and analyze City Council resolutions, City Charter and memorandum from Attorney Chubb; meet and confer with M. McInerney regarding same; meet and discuss strategy with R. Turner and M. McInerney.
04/05/18 MWM	.70	Meetings with C. Trebilcock, R. Turner regarding status and strategy; review additional documents; phone discussions with M. Sharpe (2) regarding status of resolutions; email to and from M. Sharpe.

## CLARK HILL P.L.C.

City of Pontiac, MI  
City council advice and legal counsel  
May 17, 2018  
INVOICE # 781268  
Page 3

04/06/18 RMT	.50	Review and respond to memos regarding council matters.
04/06/18 MWM	.20	Review new documents, emails to and from R. Turner, C. Trebilcock regarding strategy.
04/09/18 RMT	.30	Review and respond to memos regarding City Council matters.
04/09/18 MWM	.60	Begin drafting complaint against Mayor.
04/10/18 MWM	2.50	Legal research regarding proper parties to action by City of Council; work on proposed complaint.
04/11/18 MWM	2.70	Continue preparation of proposed complaint; legal research regarding mandamus action.
04/12/18 MWM	3.70	Continue legal research and preparation of proposed complaint; review applicable court rules.
04/16/18 RMT	.50	Attend to council matters.
04/16/18 MWM	1.30	Review, revise and complete draft of complaint; memorandum to R. Turner, C. Trebilcock regarding strategy issues.
04/17/18 RMT	.80	Review and respond to memos regarding council matters; review and revise letter to Treasurer.
04/17/18 CMT	1.80	Meet and confer with M. McInerney regarding draft complaint; draft and revise letter regarding payment of invoice; communications with R. Turner and M. McInerney regarding same.
04/17/18 MWM	.40	Review email exchanges; discuss strategy with C. Trebilcock; revision to complaint.
04/17/18 CAD	.30	Review and modify Complaint for Mandamus and Declaratory Relief.
04/18/18 RMT	.90	Confer with council member and staff; review and respond to memos regarding same.

## CLARK HILL P.L.C.

City of Pontiac, MI  
City council advice and legal counsel  
May 17, 2018  
INVOICE # 781268  
Page 4

04/18/18	MWM	.30	Discuss strategy with C. Trebilcock; emails to and from R. Turner regarding strategy.
04/19/18	RMT	.60	Review and respond to memos regarding council matters; confer with staff.
04/20/18	RMT	.50	Review and respond to memos regarding council matters.
04/21/18	RMT	.50	Review and respond to memos regarding council matters.
04/23/18	RMT	.50	Review and respond to memos regarding matters pending before council.
04/23/18	CMT	.30	Communications with R. Turner and M. Sharpe regarding closed meeting under OMA.
04/24/18	RMT	.30	Review and respond to memos regarding matters pending before council.
04/25/18	RMT	.60	Review and respond to memos regarding litigation strategy regarding matters pending before council.
04/25/18	CMT	3.20	Draft and revise opinion letter regarding potential complaint for a writ of mandamus and declaratory judgment.
04/26/18	RMT	.60	Review and respond to memos regarding litigation strategy regarding matters pending before council.
04/26/18	CMT	.50	Review and revise letter to Council President Williams; telephone call with M. Sharpe regarding same.
04/26/18	MWM	.40	Review opinion letter, suggest revisions; miscellaneous to complete letter.
04/27/18	CMT	.70	Communications with M. Sharpe and M. McInerney regarding resolutions for closed session; review and revise resolution regarding same.

CLARK HILL P.L.C.

City of Pontiac, MI  
City council advice and legal counsel  
May 17, 2018  
INVOICE # 781268  
Page 5

04/27/18 MWM .80 Email to M. Sharpe regarding OMA requirements for closed session; draft resolution approving commencement of litigation, circulate for review.

04/30/18 CMT .50 Review and analyze memorandum from City Attorney regarding closed session; communications with M. McInerney and M. Sharpe regarding same.

04/30/18 MWM .50 Review memorandum from City Attorney regarding OMA issues; discuss with C. Trebilcock; email to R. Turner.

\$8,851.50

TIMEKEEPER SUMMARY

RMT	Reginald M. Turner, Jr	10.50 hours at	\$300.00 =	\$3,150.00
CMT	Christopher M. Trebilc	10.60 hours at	\$135.00 =	\$1,431.00
MWM	Mark W. McInerney	14.10 hours at	\$300.00 =	\$4,230.00
CAD	Cynthia A. Duda	0.30 hours at	\$135.00 =	\$40.50