

CLARK HILL

P.L.C.

ATTORNEYS AT LAW

500 Woodward Avenue
Suite 3500, Detroit, Michigan 48226-3435
Telephone (313) 965-8300
Fed.ID # 38-0425840

INVOICE

Invoice # 816125

City of Pontiac, MI
Attn: John Clark, Esq.
c/o Giarmarco, Mullins & Horton P.C.
Tenth Floor Columbia Center
101 West Big Beaver Road
Troy, MI 48084-5280

October 18, 2018
Client: 18836
Matter: 328362

=====

RE: City council advice and legal counsel

FOR SERVICES RENDERED through September 30, 2018

Total Services: \$7,020.00

FOR EXPENSES INCURRED OR ADVANCED:

Express Mail Services \$51.00

Total Expenses: \$51.00

STATEMENT TOTAL \$7,071.00

04/06/18	771208	\$4140.00
05/17/18	781268	\$8851.50
06/12/18	785121	\$4525.50
07/13/18	792583	\$6235.75
08/27/18	802354	\$9401.60
09/18/18	806251	\$14436.26

Outstanding Balance: \$47,590.61

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE \$54,661.61
=====

PAYABLE UPON RECEIPT IN U.S. DOLLARS

CLARK HILL P.L.C.

City of Pontiac, MI
October 18, 2018
INVOICE # 816125
Page 2

DETAILED DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES

09/01/18 RMT	.40	Review and respond to memos regarding appellate matters.
09/02/18 RMT	.40	Review and respond to memos regarding appellate matters.
09/17/18 RMT	.50	Review and respond to memos regarding litigation status and strategy.
09/17/18 CMF	.80	Review defendant's response to the City's application for leave to appeal; email communications regarding the same.
09/17/18 CMT	1.00	Review and analyze Defendants' response to application for leave to appeal; review and respond to communications regarding same.
09/17/18 MWM	.50	Initial review of response to application for leave to appeal; participate in conference call regarding strategy for reply.
09/18/18 CMT	3.60	Draft and revise reply brief in support of application for appeal.
09/18/18 MWM	.70	Review of response to application for leave to appeal.
09/19/18 RMT	.40	Review and respond to memos regarding litigation status and strategy.
09/19/18 CMF	.50	Review draft reply brief.
09/19/18 CMT	2.80	Review and revise reply brief in support of application for leave to appeal; communications with M. McInerney regarding same.
09/19/18 MWM	3.00	Work on reply brief.
09/20/18 RMT	.40	Review and respond to memos regarding litigation status and strategy.

CLARK HILL P.L.C.

City of Pontiac, MI
October 18, 2018
INVOICE # 816125
Page 3

09/20/18 CMF	.70	Review and revise second draft of the City Council's reply brief; email communications regarding the same.
09/20/18 CMT	.50	Review and analyze revisions to reply brief in support of application for leave to appeal.
09/20/18 MWM	4.00	Continue work on reply brief; email and phone communications with M. Sharpe regarding Council meetings in March 2018; revisions to draft.
09/21/18 RMT	.40	Review and respond to memos regarding litigation status and strategy.
09/21/18 CMT	1.30	Telephone call with M. Sharpe regarding memos to Council; review and revise reply brief in support of application for appeal; communications with R. Turner and M. McInerney regarding revisions.
09/21/18 MWM	.30	Review communications from M. Sharpe; review final draft of reply brief, suggests edits.
09/24/18 CMT	1.00	Review and revise reply brief; telephone call to COA clerk regarding timing; meet and confer with M. McInerney regarding final edits.
09/24/18 MWM	.20	Work on completion and filing of reply brief.

\$7,020.00

TIMEKEEPER SUMMARY

RMT	Reginald M. Turner, Jr	2.50 hours at	\$300.00 =	\$750.00
CMF	Cynthia M. Filipovich	2.00 hours at	\$300.00 =	\$600.00
CMT	Christopher M. Trebilc	10.20 hours at	\$300.00 =	\$3,060.00
MWM	Mark W. McInerney	8.70 hours at	\$300.00 =	\$2,610.00